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PUBLIC SCHOOLS (ASSIGNED)
Your neighbourhood is part of a community of Public Schools offering Elementary, Middle, and High School programming.
See the closest Public Schools near you below:

ÉÉ Pierre-Elliott-Trudeau

Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

65 Grace St, Toronto, ON M6J 2S4, Canada

Nous sommes heureux d’accueillir environ 360 élèves de la maternelle à la 6e année dans un milieu sécuritaire où il fait bon
apprendre. À l’école élémentaire Pierre-Elliott-Trudeau, nous préconisons le développement global de l’enfant en mettant
l’accent sur la pensée critique, la curiosité intellectuelle et l’imagination. Nous désirons outiller les enfants pour qu’ils prennent
leur place dans un monde en évolution afin de devenir des citoyens engagés.

https://csviamonde.ca...

Address 65 Grace St, Toronto, ON M6J 2S4, Canada

Language French

Grade Level Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-397-2097

School Board CS Viamonde

School Number 165476

Grades Offered PK to 6

School Board Number B66303

Charles G. Fraser Junior Public School

Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

79 Manning Ave, Toronto, ON M6J 2K6, Canada

about a 3 minute walk - 0.22 KM

about a 7 minute walk - 0.52 KM

https://csviamonde.ca/nos-ecoles/trouver-une-ecole/fiche-ecole/ecole-elementaire-pierre-elliott-trudeau/


Charles G. Fraser Public School is located near Queen and Bathurst Streets. The school was founded in 1877 as Markham
Street School. In 1926 it became Charles G. Fraser Public School in honour of Principal Fraser who had been its head from
1909 to 1928. The school currently serves over 250 students of various racial and cultural backgrounds. Charles G. Fraser
offers an International Languages Programme, (Cantonese and Mandarin), after school, for two and one half hours, one day
per week. The school has a child care centre for children 1.5-6 years , and a Parenting Centre. It is also one of the sites for the
Board's Kindergarten Intervention Program. Charles G. Fraser has a very active music programme (Vocal, Band, Strings,
Choirs).

http://www.tdsb.on.ca...

Address 79 Manning Ave, Toronto, ON M6J 2K6, Canada

Language English

Grade Level Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

School Code 5251

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-1830

School Board Toronto DSB

School Number 101737

Grades Offered PK to 6

School Board Number B66052

Alexander Muir/Gladstone Ave Jr and Sr Public School

Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten, Elementary and Middle

108 Gladstone Ave, Toronto, ON M6J 3L2, Canada

Alexander Muir/Gladstone Ave (AMG), an inner city school in the Dufferin/Dundas area, is comprised of two schools joined
together in 1982. The school also houses an alternative school, integrated international languages, adult ESL day programs, a
Parenting and Family Literacy Centre and a YMCA child care program. Alex Muir, a Scottish-Canadian poet and songwriter
who composed the lyrics to the song, “The Maple Leaf Forever,” was the first principal of the school. At AMG, staff and
students work collaboratively to create a positive learning environment where all students are respected and valued as
individuals.

http://www.tdsb.on.ca...

Address 108 Gladstone Ave, Toronto, ON M6J 3L2, Canada

Language English

Grade Level Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten, Elementary and Middle

School Code 5200

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-9140

School Board Toronto DSB

School Number 009172

Grades Offered PK to 8

Additional Details English as a Second Language

School Board Number B66052

Harbord Collegiate Institute

High

286 Harbord St, Toronto, ON M6G 1G5, Canada

Since 1892, Harbord Collegiate Institute has had a long tradition of academic excellence and a faculty committed to
preparing students well for postsecondary studies and for their role as responsible and productive members of our society.
The school has a current enrolment of 1100+ students and a staff of over 95. Our focus on social justice, equity and the
environment sets the framework for a dynamic education. Harbord Collegiate Institute offers a diverse range in programming
including a Specialist High Skills Major (non-profit), a LAWs program, and many languages such as Spanish, Portuguese, and

1.59 KM away

about a 13 minute walk - 0.97 KM

http://www.tdsb.on.ca/FindYour/Schools.aspx?schno=5251
http://www.tdsb.on.ca/FindYour/Schools.aspx?schno=5200


French (including immersion and extended French). The school also has an ESL programme that meets the needs of students
who have recently arrived in Canada. Harbord was awarded the TDSB Anne Hope Award for Social Justice and Equity and has
earned Platinum certification as an Eco-School.

http://www.tdsb.on.ca...

Address 286 Harbord St, Toronto, ON M6G 1G5, Canada

Language English

Date Opened 01-09-1969

Grade Level High

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-1650

School Board Toronto DSB

School Number 915688

Grades Offered 9 to 12

Additional Details French Immersion and English as a Second Language

School Board Number B66052

District Description Toronto and Area Regional Office

ÉS Toronto Ouest

High and Middle

330 Lansdowne Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 3Y1, Canada

L’école secondaire Toronto Ouest continue de bâtir un milieu d’apprentissage franchement exemplaire. Ce milieu diversifié,
inclusif et sécuritaire offre à ses élèves des programmes d’excellence en sciences, mathématiques, langues, études sociales et
arts. De nombreux clubs et activités socioculturelles et sportives viennent agrémenter le quotidien de nos élèves, leur
permettant de joindre l’utile à l’agréable. Fondés sur des valeurs d’excellence, d’engagement et de dépassement de soi,
l’enseignement et l’encadrement offerts à nos élèves leur permettent « de voir un avenir à la hauteur de leur vision où les
choix de carrières sont guidés par leurs passions et qui offre la possibilité et les ressources nécessaires à leur réalisation ».

https://csviamonde.ca...

Address 330 Lansdowne Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 3Y1, Canada

Language French

Grade Level High and Middle

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-532-6592

School Board CS Viamonde

School Number 952803

Grades Offered 7 to 12

Additional Details International Baccalaureate

School Board Number B66303

PUBLIC SCHOOLS (NEARBY)

Downtown Vocal Music Academy of Toronto

Middle

96 Denison Ave, Toronto, ON M5T 2N1, Canada

Singing, performing and learning about music and performance are at the core of the VMA for boys and girls with a passion to
sing and perform. Students will experience music from around the world and learn about the musicians and music that have
shaped our world. Also, music will be integrated into many other areas of the curriculum.

http://www.tdsb.on.ca...

Address 96 Denison Ave, Toronto, ON M5T 2N1, Canada

2.35 KM away

about a 10 minute walk - 0.76 KM

http://www.tdsb.on.ca/FindYour/Schools.aspx?schno=5510
https://csviamonde.ca/nos-ecoles/trouver-une-ecole/fiche-ecole/ecole-secondaire-toronto-ouest/
http://www.tdsb.on.ca/FindYour/Schools.aspx?schno=5906


Language English

Date Opened 01-09-2012

Grade Level Middle

School Code 5906

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-1340

School Board Toronto DSB

School Number 491997

Grades Offered 4 to 8

Additional Details Special Focus and Fine Arts

School Board Number B66052

District Description Toronto and Area Regional Office

Central Toronto Academy

High

570 Shaw St, Toronto, ON M6G 3L6, Canada

Central Toronto Academy is a school that embraces 21st century learning. Our small size, caring staff and semestered format
foster a climate that provides our students with a high school experience optimised for their personal growth and
development. At CTA, we are Digital Innovators with classes offered online and blended learning formats where students
receive Chromebooks in grade 9. In our diverse and inclusive learning environment, students become Compassionate
Leaders who develop their skills through our leadership courses, student council and numerous extra-curricular clubs and
activities. Driven by our strong SHSM, Bike and Cooperative education programs students become Experiential Learners.

http://www.tdsb.on.ca...

Address 570 Shaw St, Toronto, ON M6G 3L6, Canada

Language English

Grade Level High

School Code 5805

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-0030

School Board Toronto DSB

School Number 899437

Grades Offered 9 to 12

School Board Number B66052

CATHOLIC SCHOOLS (ASSIGNED)
Your neighbourhood is part of a community of Catholic Schools offering Elementary, Middle, and High School programming.
See the closest Catholic Schools near you below:

St. Francis of Assisi Catholic School

Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten, Elementary and Middle

80 Clinton St, Toronto, ON M6G 2Y3, Canada

St. Francis of Assisi school is one of the original six parochial schools in the Greater Toronto Area. The original school was at
250 Manning Avenue from 1895 until the new turn of the new millennium. In 2000, the school moved to its current location at
80 Clinton Street. Currently, there are 155 students from JK to Grade 8 enrolled at the school. In addition to regular class
settings, the school services a wide range of student abilities, from a class for students with Learning Disabilities, to Mild
Intellectual Disabilities. St. Francis of Assisi is now the home of a new congregated gifted program for students in grades 6-8.

https://www.tcdsb.org...

Address 80 Clinton St, Toronto, ON M6G 2Y3, Canada

Language English

about a 13 minute walk - 0.95 KM

about a 6 minute walk - 0.45 KM

http://www.tdsb.on.ca/FindYour/Schools.aspx?schno=5805
https://www.tcdsb.org/o/stfrancisofassisi


Grade Level Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten, Elementary and Middle

Orientation Catholic

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-5206

School Board Toronto CDSB

School Number 791679

Grades Offered PK to 8

Additional Details Gifted/Talented Program, Religious and Special Needs Program

School Board Number B67059

ÉÉC du Sacré-Coeur-Toronto

Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

98 Essex Street, Toronto, ON, Canada M6G 1T3

L’école élémentaire catholique du Sacré-Cœur a 125 ans d’histoire! C’est avec enthousiasme que travaille une équipe
dynamique. L’école accueille plus de 150 élèves de la maternelle à la 6e année. La langue française et la catholicité sont des
priorités chez nous. Aux niveaux académique et personnel, nous rassemblons nos efforts en vue de permettre aux élèves
d’atteindre leur plein potentiel.

https://sct.cscmonavenir.ca...

Address 98 Essex Street, Toronto, ON, Canada M6G 1T3

Language French

Grade Level Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Elementary

Orientation Catholic

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-5219

School Board CS catholique MonAvenir

School Number 755532

Grades Offered PK to 6

Additional Details Religious

School Board Number B67318

ÉSC Saint-Frère-André

High and Middle

330 Lansdowne Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 3Y1, Canada

L’école secondaire Saint-Frère-André est une école accueillant les élèves de la 7e à la 12e année. Notre but premier en tant
qu’établissement d’éducation est avant tout l’apprentissage et le développement de votre enfant dans un milieu francophone
catholique stimulant. En vue d’offrir un enseignement de qualité et un choix intéressant d’options à nos élèves, nous offrons
toute une panoplie d’activités parascolaires, ainsi que des programmes d’enseignement. «Offrir à l’élève une éducation de
qualité dans un milieu de vie catholique et francophone où le respect de la personne, le sens d’appartenance à la collectivité
franco-ontarienne, la promotion de l’excellence et enfin l’équité sont des valeurs visibles et essentielles à son épanouissement
». C’est non seulement la mission du conseil scolaire mais aussi celle des enseignants.

https://essfa.cscmonavenir.ca...

Address 330 Lansdowne Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 3Y1, Canada

Language French

Grade Level High and Middle

Orientation Catholic

School Type Public

School Board CS catholique MonAvenir

School Number 691950

Grades Offered 7 to 12

Additional Details Religious and International Baccalaureate

1.94 KM away

2.35 KM away

https://sct.cscmonavenir.ca/
https://essfa.cscmonavenir.ca/


School Board Number B67318

CATHOLIC SCHOOLS (NEARBY)
Your neighbourhood is part of a community of Catholic Schools offering Elementary, Middle, and High School programming.
See the closest Catholic Schools near you below:

Mary Mother of God School

Elementary, High, Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Middle

1515 Queen Street West, Toronto, ON M6R

Since 1993, Mary, Mother of God School, an affordable, coeducational, independent school in the Catholic tradition, has been
dedicated to providing an academically solid, well-balanced education in a joyful environment. Since the autumn of 2010,
with the foundation of The Francis de Sales Centre, the school has been offering a high school education as well.

http://www.marymotherofgodschool.org...

Address 1515 Queen Street West, Toronto, ON M6R

Affiliation Christian

Grade Level Elementary, High, Pre-Kindergarten, Kindergarten and Middle

Orientation Catholic

School Type Private

Contact Name Gordon Nixon (Secondary), Gordon Nixon (Elementary)

Phone Number 416-531-7897

School Board N/A

School Number 876160

Grades Offered PK to 12

Additional Details Religious

District Description Toronto and Area Regional Office

St. Mary Catholic Academy

High

66 Dufferin Park Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 1J6, Canada

The St. Mary’s community is built on our Catholic Gospel values, which are the foundation of our school philosophy. It is for
that reason – our commitment to being witnesses of our faith – that we nurture the spiritual and religious development of all
members of our community. Our commitment to our religious journey is marked by several important community-building
traditions, including daily prayers, regular school masses, and liturgies. In addition, we have an active Chaplaincy Team that
provides support to our community as we nurture the development of the whole child.

https://www.tcdsb.org...

Address 66 Dufferin Park Ave, Toronto, ON M6H 1J6, Canada

Language English

Grade Level High

Orientation Catholic

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-5528

School Board Toronto CDSB

School Number 689831

Grades Offered 9 to 12

Additional Details Religious and International Baccalaureate

School Board Number B67059

St. Joseph's College School

2.8 KM away

1.71 KM away

2.22 KM away

http://www.marymotherofgodschool.org/
https://www.tcdsb.org/o/stmarycatholicacademy


High

74 Wellesley St W, Toronto, ON M5S 1C4, Canada

The motto of St. Joseph’s College School is “Congregavit nos in unum Christi amor” (The love of Christ has gathered us
together into one). This has reflected a long tradition of educating young women by focusing on their intellectual, physical,
social and creative abilities in a loving, Catholic, faith-filled environment. Respect for the rights and dignity of all and service to
others are important in our daily lives. The school is organized on a two-semester system and courses are offered at the
Academic, Applied, Locally Developed, and Pre-Advanced Placement levels in grades 9 and 10, and at the University, College,
Workplace, and Advanced Placement levels in grades 11 and 12. Specialty programs include: Gifted, Extended French,
Rhythm and Movement, a sport-focused program in basketball, and Advanced Placement preparation in: Mathematics,
Science, History and English. St. Joseph’s College School is a diverse and progressive community where every attempt is
made to meet the needs of all students. We have provided over 155 years of tradition and excellence in the education of
young women in Toronto and we invite any young woman who wishes to maximize her talents and leadership abilities to join
our school community for her high school career!

https://www.tcdsb.org...

Address 74 Wellesley St W, Toronto, ON M5S 1C4, Canada

Language English

Grade Level High

Orientation Catholic

School Type Public

Phone Number 416-393-5514

School Board Toronto CDSB

School Number 814954

Grades Offered 9 to 12

Additional Details Religious, Advanced Placement, Gifted/Talented Program, All-Female and French Immersion

School Board Number B67059

St. Michael's College School

High and Middle

1515 Bathurst Street, Toronto, ON M5P

St. Michael’s College School was founded in 1852 by the Basilian Fathers, and stands as Ontario’s only independent Catholic
school for young men. The school offers students in Grades 7-12 an enriched, Catholic, Liberal Arts education complemented
by a number of diverse co-curricular programmes. As a community within the Catholic Church, St. Michael’s strives for
excellence through a synthesis of culture and faith. The motto of the Basilian Fathers and St. Michael’s College School is
“Teach me Goodness, Discipline, and Knowledge” (Psalm 118). This recognizes that being a good and disciplined individual,
in charge of your own actions, is as important as the knowledge acquired through formal education. The motto is reflected in
our mission to educate the whole person. Toward that end, St. Michael’s offers a Catholic, Liberal Arts education that exposes
young men to as wide a range of knowledge as possible, encompassing the Humanities, the Arts, and the Sciences.

http://www.stmichaelscollegeschool.com...

Address 1515 Bathurst Street, Toronto, ON M5P

Affiliation Christian and Catholic

Grade Level High and Middle

Orientation Catholic

School Type Private

Contact Name Terence Sheridan

Phone Number 416-653-3180

School Board N/A

School Number 887145

Grades Offered 7 to 12

Additional Details Religious and All-Male

District Description Toronto and Area Regional Office

PRIVATE SCHOOLS
See a list of the closest private schools near you:

3.58 KM away

https://www.tcdsb.org/o/stjosephcollege
http://www.stmichaelscollegeschool.com/


Westside Montessori School - Kensington Market

Braemar College

about a 10 minute walk - 0.76 KM

about a 17 minute walk - 1.29 KM

PARKS & REC.
Whether you want to sit at a park bench with a good book or use one of the special facilities offered, you'll be happy to know
that your neighbourhood is close to many wonderful recreational opportunities. See Parks and Recreation facilities near you
below:

Scadding Court Community Centre
707 Dundas St W

This location is a community centre where programs are free.

1 Pool, 1 Community Centre, and 1 Gym

https://www.toronto.ca...

Alexandra Park
275 Bathurst St

A 2.7 hectare park at Bathurst Street and Dundas Street West featuring a ball diamond, picnic area, community garden,
volleyball court, skateboard area, wading pool and a children's playground. On the west side of the park is the Alexandra
Park/Harry Gairey Outdoor Artificial Ice Rink. On the north side of the park is the Alexandra Park Outdoor Pool and the
Scadding Court Community Centre.

1 Pool, 1 Playground, 1 Wading Pool, 1 Volleyball Court, 1 Splash Pad, 1 Ball Diamond, 1 Rink, 1 Skateboard Park, 2 Picnic
Facilities, and 1 Community Garden

https://www.toronto.ca...

Fred Hamilton Playground
155 Roxton Rd

A 1.6 hectare park near College Street and Ossington Avenue featuring two outdoor bocce courts, outdoor fitness
equipment, picnic areas, a wading pool and a children's playground with many mature trees throughout.

1 Playground, 1 Wading Pool, 1 Trail, 2 Lawn Bowling/Bocce Greens, and 1 Picnic Facilities

https://www.toronto.ca...

Trinity Bellwoods Park
790 Queen St W

A 14.6 hectare park on Queen Street West at Strachan Avenue once the home of University of Trinity College (Trinity College).
The park sits atop the now buried Garrison Creek and features three ball diamonds, eight tennis courts, two volleyball courts,
an artificial ice rink, a dog off-leash area, a picnic area, a wading pool and a children's playground.

1 Dog Park, 2 Playgrounds, 1 Wading Pool, 2 Sports Fields, 8 Tennis Courts, 2 Volleyball Courts, 3 Ball Diamonds, 1 Rink, 2
Trails, 2 Clubhouses, 2 Outdoor Dry Pads, and 1 Picnic Facilities

https://www.toronto.ca...

about a 6 minute walk - 0.49 KM

about a 7 minute walk - 0.53 KM

about a 8 minute walk - 0.63 KM

about a 5 minute walk - 0.34 KM

TRANSIT
The public transit system can be an easy, cost-effective and efficient way of getting around the city, accessible from your
neighbourhood. See the closest Public Transit stops near you below:

https://www.toronto.ca/data/parks/prd/facilities/complex/1098/index.html
https://www.toronto.ca/data/parks/prd/facilities/complex/31/index.html
https://www.toronto.ca/data/parks/prd/facilities/complex/72/index.html
https://www.toronto.ca/data/parks/prd/facilities/complex/241/index.html


The nearest rail transit stop is Christie Station

http://www.ttc.ca...

The nearest street-level transit stop is Dundas St West At Manning
Ave

http://www.ttc.ca...

about a 19 minute walk - 1.39 KM

about a 3 minute walk - 0.19 KM

SAFETY
Every second matters in an emergency, and your neighbourhood is part of a dedicated safety system of emergency agencies
including Fire Stations, Police Stations, and Hospitals. See the closest facilities near you below:

Toronto Western Hospital (University Health Network)
Toronto Western Hospital is located in the vibrant heart of the downtown communities of South Annex, College, Queen and
King Street West. It is a 272-bed academic health science centre dedicated to delivering exceptional patient care, providing a
breadth of services from emergency care to sophisticated brain surgery. As a world leader in neuroscience, TWH is constantly
pushing the boundaries of research, offering pioneering treatments and using state-of-the-art technology. The hospital also
has a strong community focus, providing innovative programs for and information to children, seniors, diabetes patients and
many multicultural groups. With expertise in musculoskeletal health and arthritis, the hospital's programs also include
orthopaedics, rheumatology and the hand program as well as a busy Emergency Department that sees more than 60,000
patients yearly.

Type Emergency Care, General, Research and Teaching

Address 399 Bathurst St, Toronto, ON, M5T 2S8, Canada

Phone Number 416 603 2581

https://www.uhn.ca...

The nearest fire station is Fire Station 331

Address 33 Claremont St, Toronto, ON, Canada

https://www.toronto.ca...

The nearest police facility is 14 Division

Address 350 Dovercourt Rd, Toronto, ON, M6J 3E3, Canada

http://www.torontopolice.on.ca...

0.44 KM away

0.63 KM away

1.08 KM away

http://www.ttc.ca/Subway/Stations/Christie/station.jsp
http://www.ttc.ca/
https://www.uhn.ca/OurHospitals/TWH
https://www.toronto.ca/community-people/public-safety-alerts/understanding-emergency-services/fire-station-locations/
http://www.torontopolice.on.ca/d14/
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